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GOVERNMENT NOTICE No. 21 Published on 17/1/2025 
 

THE EXCISE (MANAGEMENT AND TARIFF) ACT, 
(CAP. 147) 

______ 
 

ORDER 
_____ 

 
(Made under section 128) 

 
THE EXCISE (MANAGEMENT AND TARIFF) (REMISSION) (1 MOTOR VEHICLE) 

(REPRESENTATIVE OF UNITED NATIONS HIGH COMMISSIONER FOR 
REFUGEES IN TANZANIA) ORDER, 2025 

 
Citation and 
Commencement 

 1. This Order may be cited as the Excise 
(Management and Tariff) (Remission) (1 Motor Vehicle) 
(Representative of United Nations High Commissioner 
for Refugees in Tanzania) Order, 2025 and shall be 
deemed to have come into operation on the 31st October, 
2024. 

  
Remission  2. Subject to the conditions specified in paragraph 

3, and any other conditions as may be specified by the 
Commissioner General of Tanzania Revenue Authority, 
the whole of the excise duty payable on the motor vehicle 
specified in the Schedule to this Order imported or 
purchased locally prior to clearance through customs by 
or on behalf of the Representative for United Nations 
High Commissioner for Refugees in Tanzania to be used 
solely in Refugees Program in Kigoma Region is hereby 
remitted. 

  
Conditions  3. The exemption granted under this Order shall 

cease to have effect and the excise duty shall become due 
and be payable as if this remission under this Order had 
not been granted if the said motor vehicle is used for other 
purposes or transferred, sold or disposed of in any way to 
another person not entitled to enjoy similar privileges as 
conferred under this Order. 
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Expiry  4.  This Order shall expire on 31st March, 2025. 
 

________ 
 

SCHEDULE 
_________ 

 
(Made under paragraph 2) 

____________ 
 
SN Vehicle 

Type 
Year Engine 

Number 
Quantity Engine Number Purchase 

Area – 
Local 
Imported 

1 Toyota Land 
Cruiser, 
hard top 
converted to 
Ambulance, 
Model year 
2023, White 
Colour, 
Diesel RHD 

2023 1HZT1061
729 

01 JTERB71J30F027283 Imported 

 
 
 
Dodoma,             MWIGULU LAMECK NCHEMBA MADELU, 

30th December, 2024               Minister of Finance 


